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Detail 03

Scale 1:10 @ A1

Proposed Bathroom Door Opening Closing up and New Ensuite

Joinery profiles indicative only, final are to be taken from site and recorded, where profiles

are to be removed.

Existing box sash window to be
retained.

Existing rendered masonry wall.

Timber single glazed 'westmoreland'
window, to be replace due to poor
condition.

Existing painted window board to be
retained / carefully removed as part of
window replacement works.

Existing stair stringer and skirting
boards to be retained.

Existing bathroom door architrave to be
retained.

Existing door reveal and rebates to be
retained.

12.5mm Gyproc plasterboard or similar
approved lining with 4mm Solo Lime
Plaster.

100x47mm softwood timber studs
between existing door opening, provide
100mm full fill mineral wool insulation
between studs.

Existing bedroom to skirting to be
retained.

New timber 6 panel door to match
existing on wall mounted roller track.

Existing wall to be partially demolished
to form new opening, new beam over
to be provided above, refer to S.E
details for further information.

35 x 315mm painted timber opening
reveal panel to newly formed opening.

Existing bathroom skirting to be
retained. Where new opening is
formed, portion of skirting that was
present is to be carefully removed and
cut back to allow for return end to

timber reveal.
New shower tray and screen, type and
specification to be confirmed with
client.

15mm moisture resistant plasterboard
with 4mm Solo Lime Plaster to finish.

Gypframe 70mm 'C' stud framing fixed
to existing floor & ceiling.

19mm Schluter Kerdi board for tile
backing, with Schluter
KERDI-SHOWER-SK Waterproofing Kits
KSS5/KSS10. Boarding to be installed
in strict accordance with manufacturers
details prior to receiving tiling / stone.

Existing 6 panel door to be removed.

Gypframe 48mm 'C' stud framing fixed
to existing floor & ceiling.

Existing bathroom side, cut architrave
to be retained and hidden behind new
shower walling to enable the potential
for reinstatement of door opening.

50mm Thermafleece sheep wool
insulation to be breathable /
hygrascopic placed between studs.

Existing window surround architrave
and paneling to be recorded, and
carefully removed.

Painted replacement architrave,
moulding profile to match existing.

Painted replacement splayed timber
paneling, with scotia beading to recess
to match existing.

Existing chamfered edge window board
to be removed and replaced to extend
to new insulated stud wall.

Existing timber sash window to be
retained.
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Detail 3 - Bathroom Door Closing Plan
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