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Introduction 
 
Erection of replacement dwelling (C3) and formation of associated ancillary parking and 
incidental land at 8 Station Road, Elmesthorpe, LE9 7SG. 
 
This Statement has been prepared in accordance with the requirements of the Town and 
Country Planning Act 1990 (as amended by the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 
2004) and the provisions of the Town and Country Planning ( General Development 
Procedure) (Amendment) Order 2010 and Town and Country Planning ( Development 
Management Procedure) (Amendment) Order 2015. 
 
In accordance with the National Planning Policy Guidance (NPPG), the level of detail 
presented in this statement is proportionate to the scale and complexity of the application. 
References were made to the relevant planning policies. These are predominantly the 
adopted and saved Local Plan policies as they take primacy in the determination of such an 
application where they are NPPF & NPPG compliant. 
 
Relevant  Planning Policy 
 
Section 38(6) of the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004 and section 70(2) of the 
Town and Country Planning 1990 requires that applications for planning permission must be 
determined in accordance with the development plan, unless material considerations 
indicate otherwise. 
 
National Policy Guidance 
 
National Planning Policy Guidance ( NPPG). 
National Planning Policy Framework (NPPF) 2023 
Community Infrastructure Levy (CIL) Regulations 2010 
 
Development Management Policies DPD 
 
Blaby District Local Plan (Core Strategy) Development Plan Document (2013) 
 
CS1 – Strategy for Locating New Development 
CS2 – Design of New Development 
CS24 – Presumption in Favour of Sustainable Development 
 
Blaby District Local Plan Delivery Development Plan Document (2019) 
 
DM2 – Development in the Countryside 
DM8 - Local Parking & Highway Design Standards 
 
Principle and other material planning considerations 
 
The Written Ministerial Statement Planning for Growth and Laying the Foundations 
emphasized the Government’s approach to house building and the need to provide action to 
build more houses and to boost economic growth. Although now superseded by the NPPG, 
it remains fully reinforced by the NPPF (2023) where the Government’s aim remains to 
significantly boost the supply of housing.  
 
The NPPF identifies three dimensions to sustainable development giving rise for the 
planning system to perform the roles below: 



“an economic role – contributing to building a strong, responsive and competitive economy, 
by ensuring that sufficient land of the right type is available in the right places and at the right 
time to support growth and innovation; and by identifying and coordinating development 
requirements, including the provision of infrastructure; 

a social role – supporting strong, vibrant and healthy communities, by providing the supply 
of housing required to meet the needs of present and future generations; and by creating a 
high quality built environment, with accessible local services that reflect the community’s 
needs and support its health, social and cultural well-being; and 

an environmental role – contributing to protecting and enhancing our natural, built and 
historic environment; and, as part of this, helping to improve biodiversity, use natural 
resources prudently, minimise waste and pollution, and mitigate and adapt to climate change 
including moving to a low carbon economy.” 
 
Furthermore, LP policy should follow the approach of the presumption in favour of 
sustainable development where such development should be supported when weighing all 
of the provisions of the NPPF2 as a complete document. 
 
The Government is committed to ensuring the planning system should not act as an 
impediment to housing provision. All Local Authorities need to significantly boost the supply 
of housing irrespective of the status of the immediate 5 YHLS. In reference to their report 
“Building More Homes” (July 2016) the cross-party House of Lords Economic Affairs 
Committee Chairman Lord Hollick stated:  
 
“We are facing an acute housing crisis with home ownership – and increasingly renting- 
being simply unaffordable for a great many people. The only way to address this is to 
increase supply. The country needs to build 300,000 homes a year for the foreseeable 
future.” 
 
This conclusion was reinforced in November 2016 when the RPTI released a Policy 
Statement on identifying new housing development opportunities entitled: Where should we 
build more homes? Under section “land within existing built up areas will not meet all our 
needs” the Statement concludes:  
 
“Even with an enhanced urban renewal and regeneration programmes of action and funding, 
land within existing built up areas will not meet all our housing needs in full. Some of the 
future housing needs will have to be met on greenfield land around our towns and cities. The 
experience of our members clearly indicates that this can be done without undermining the 
priority to be given to brownfield sites through a planned, managed and phased approach to 
development.” 
 

Paragraph 11 of the National Planning Policy Framework (NPPF) sets out a presumption in 
favour of sustainable development, and state that development proposals that accord with 
the development plan should be approved unless other material considerations indicate 
otherwise, and it is considered the proposal fully accords with Policy DM2 in relation to 
replacement dwellings. 

Local List Requirements 

Due to the scale and nature of the proposal, the level of detail submitted with the application 
is considered proportionate. Schedule 4 of the DMPO details the statutory consultations 
required before the grant of permission. If during the determination period the statutory 
consultees request additional information and this is not provided by the applicant, the LPA 
could refuse the application for this reason. On this basis this section forms a notice under 



Article 12(1) (DMPO Amended July 2015) as the applicant considers the submitted 
information meets the requirements set out in article 34(6)(c) and any other information 
contained in the adopted Local List should be waived allowing the immediate validation of 
the application. 
 
Relevant Planning History 
 
Approved 3rd August 1992 - Single storey extension to existing lounge. Planning Ref: 
92/0736/1/PX TLC. 
 
Approved 27th June 1978 - Retention of boarding kennels. Planning Ref: 78/0910/1/R TLC 
 
Approved 18th April 1978 - Retention of outbuildings as kennels. Planning Ref: 78/0460/1/R 
TLC 
 
Approved 8th November 1977 - Erection of double garage. Planning Ref: 77/0975/1/PBR 
TLC 
 
Amount, Layout & Design 
 
The Framework seeks to protect communities from inappropriate development but not to 
curtail development where it accords with Local Plan policy. Planning policies and decisions 
should no longer attempt to impose architectural styles however it is proper to seek to 
promote or reinforce local distinctiveness and reflect the adjacent built form.  
 
Paragraph 139 of the Framework that states: 
 
“Development that is not well designed should be refused, especially where it fails to reflect 
local design policies and government guidance on design, taking into account any local 
design guidance and supplementary planning documents such as design guides and codes.  
 
Conversely, significant weight should be given to: 
 
development which reflects local design policies and government guidance on design, taking 
into account any local design guidance and supplementary planning documents such as 
design guides and codes;” 
 
The current property has a lawful use for a commercial kennels business however the fabric 
of the residential (C3) building is now at the stage it is not capable of meeting either 
environmental or modern building regulation standards through adaptation or retrospective 
remedial works, so demolishing the property and replacing it with the submitted proposal will 
secure environmental gains whilst also improving the setting of the street scene. 
Based on this principle it is considered the proposal represents sustainable development 
and can be supported as the recycling of previously developed land, that demonstrably and 
positively contributes to the adjacent residential built form along this section of Station Road. 
 
In the overall policy context, the scheme reflects and continues the existing residential built 
form and therefore represents an integrated and sustainable development that would be in 
accordance with paragraph 70 of the Framework that states:  
 
“Small and medium sized sites can make an important contribution to meeting the housing 
requirement of an area, and are often built-out relatively quickly.”  
 
 
 



Access Parking & Sustainability 
 
A new private access will be utilised and parking can be accommodated within the scheme 
to meet the necessary requirements of the new dwelling that will include charging facilities 
for electric vehicles. 
 
PPG13 and associated guidance is replaced by paragraph 115 of the NPPF states: 
 

“Development should only be prevented or refused on highways grounds if there would be 
an unacceptable impact on highway safety, or the residual cumulative impacts on the road 
network would be severe.”  
 
 When considering the above, the modest amount of development and the percentage 
impacts of this traffic are considered minimal meaning the impact of the development will 
have effectively ‘nil detriment’ and will not therefore adversely affect the current road network 
capacity. 
 
Affordable Housing & S106 Contributions 
 
The Community Infrastructure Levy (CIL) Regulations 2010, Part 11, Regulation 122 
provides a statutory duty in respect of planning obligations and requires them to be 
necessary, directly related and fairly and reasonably related in scale and kind to the 
development proposed.  
 
Any contributions sought by the LPA will have to provide a site specific analysis of the 
impact of the proposed development upon on existing services. A description of how the 
contributions would be spent to specifically address those impacts and the timeframe will 
also form part of the justification. 
 
If the LPA can demonstrate that any contributions are necessary to make the development 
acceptable in planning terms, that they are directly related, are fairly and reasonably related 
in scale and kind to the development, then in accordance with Regulation 122, the applicant 
would agree to the request of the associated contributions. The contribution will be secured 
via a signed Unilateral Undertaking or S106 upon receipt of the detailed justification supplied 
to the applicant by the LPA. 
 
Conclusion & Justification 
 
The presumption in favour of sustainable development applies in this instance and as such 
the proposal represents the type of organic, integrated and sustainable development that is 
appropriate within the local context and is supported by the direction of travel in terms of 
Government policy and the key policy objectives of the existing Local Plan and other similar 
C3 residential approvals in close proximity of the site.  
 

 
© Simon Cheshire Planning Ltd 2024 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


